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Cannabis is commonly used by patients with inflammatory 
bowel disease (IBD) to ameliorate their symptoms. Patients 
claim that cannabis reduces pain, increases appetite, and 
reduces the need for other medications [1–3]. The preva-
lence of cannabis use in patients with IBD is 15–40% [4], 
including among pediatric patients [5]. Nevertheless, few 
scientifically sound data exist regarding the value of can-
nabis in the treatment of IBD. This discrepancy between the 
patient’s perception of cannabis as an effective medicine and 
physician’s reluctance to use non-evidence-based treatment 
often creates a conflict between patients and physicians, with 
few IBD patients consulting their medical doctors about can-
nabis use [6]. More evidence about the value of cannabis 
as a treatment for inflammatory bowel disease is urgently 
needed.

Although the cannabis plant contains over 100 dif-
ferent cannabinoids [7], research has focused mainly on 
Δ9-tetrahydrocannabinol (THC) and cannabidiol (CBD). 
THC is the substance responsible for the psychoactive 
effects of cannabis, including euphoria, pain relief, and 
memory impairment [8], whereas CBD has an anti-inflam-
matory effect [9] as well as a protective effect against THC-
induced psychosis [10]. Other substances contained in the 
plant include other cannabinoids, terpenes, and flavonoids 
that act synergistically and are responsible for strain-specific 
differences [11, 12].

The phytocannabinoids activate the cannabinoid recep-
tors CB1, CB2, TRPV1, and GPR55 [13], all of which are 
part of the endocannabinoid system, a system that has an 
important homeostatic function including modulation of 
neuroprotection, pain, emotional memory, hunger, feeding, 

lipid metabolism, and most importantly in the context of 
IBD, immunity, and inflammation [14, 15]. Many laboratory 
studies demonstrated that the endocannabinoid system is an 
important component of inflammatory activity in IBD and 
that treatment with cannabinoids can ameliorate the disease 
impact in experimental models of IBD by reducing inflam-
mation and tissue damage [4, 16].

Human studies of cannabis in IBD are mostly limited to 
reports of the prevalence and description of the reasons for 
cannabis use among IBD patients. In a recent study by Pi 
et al., patients with IBD reported more cannabis use com-
pared with the non-IBD population, 74.4% (125/168) ver-
sus 48.3% (28/58) (p < 0.001). The cannabis users stated 
that cannabis improved their pain, appetite, and diarrhea 
[17]. Weiss et al. analyzed patterns of cannabis use among 
2,084,895 subjects with IBD and 2,013,901 control subjects. 
Subjects with IBD had a higher incidence of ever having 
used cannabis, started using at a younger age, and used 
a greater amount per day [18]. Storr et al. observed that 
cannabis had been used by 17.6% of respondents to their 
questionnaire and that in patients with Crohn’s disease, the 
use of cannabis for > 6 months was a strong predictor of 
surgical treatment (odds ratio = 5.03; 95% confidence inter-
val = 1.45–17.46) [19]. Contrary to that finding, Mbachi 
et al. compared the prevalence of Crohn’s disease-related 
complications among patients who were cannabis users 
(n = 615) and nonusers (n = 42,702) in a study published in 
this issue of Digestive Diseases and Sciences. They observed 
that cannabis users were less likely to develop Crohn’s dis-
ease-related complications including active fistulizing dis-
ease, intra-abdominal abscess, need for blood transfusion, 
colectomy, and need for parenteral nutrition. Comorbidity 
was significantly lower among cannabis users, but the preva-
lence of concurrent psychiatric diseases was significantly 
higher [20]. The conflicting data between these two studies 
emphasize the question as to whether the beneficial effect of 
cannabis is the result of masking disease symptoms, or due 
to a true anti-inflammatory effect.
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The above-mentioned studies are all limited to inspecting 
the prevalence of cannabis use among IBD patients. Unfor-
tunately, there are no data on the dose, type, and mode of 
cannabis consumption. Stith et al. used mobile device soft-
ware to collect data from 3341 cannabis users affected with 
several diseases [21]. The main outcome was the change in 
symptom severity, as reported by the patient. THC levels 
were independently associated with greater symptom relief, 
whereas CBD levels were not, implying that THC is the 
substance responsible for the symptomatic improvement 
reported by the patients. Nonetheless, conclusions regard-
ing the appropriate dose of cannabis in these diseases cannot 
be drawn from that study.

Randomized controlled studies investigating cannabis 
use in IBD are few and small. We performed a preliminary 
double-blind, placebo-controlled study of cannabis use in 
Crohn’s disease in which 21 patients were given cigarettes 
containing 11.5 mg of THC or placebo [22]. A decrease 
in Crohn’s disease activity index (CDAI) of > 100 was 
observed in 10/11 (90%) subjects in the cannabis group 
but only 4/10 (40%) in the placebo group (p = 0.028). Yet, 
we did not observe changes in the inflammatory biomarker 
C-RP. A similar study using oral 10 mg CBD twice daily in 
Crohn’s disease was negative. Only 19 patients completed 
the study, and after 8 weeks of treatment, the CDAI was 
220 ± 122 and 216 ± 121 in the CBD and placebo groups, 
respectively (p = NS) [23]. Irving et al., in a double-blind 
placebo-controlled study, assessed the efficacy of CBD-rich 
botanical extract, also containing 4% THC, in 60 ulcera-
tive colitis patients [24]. Remission rates were similar for 
CBD (28%) and placebo (26%). The study drug was poorly 
tolerated, with only 59% protocol compliance, so when per-
forming a per-protocol analysis of the partial and the total 
Mayo scores, the investigators found a significant differ-
ence in favor of the study drug (p = 0.068 and p = 0.038, 
respectively).

In conclusion, considering the mechanism of action of 
phytocannabinoids and the accumulating evidence of their 
anti-inflammatory effects in experimental and in vitro stud-
ies, it is reasonable to assume that cannabis can be of benefit 
in the treatment of IBD. While many of our patients are con-
vinced that cannabis is ameliorating their disease manifes-
tations, clinicians continue to observe rather than to inves-
tigate this phenomenon. If cannabis really has therapeutic 
potential, it must be studied further such as in the study by 
Mbachi et al. that points to a possibility of cannabis improv-
ing not only patients’ symptoms but also disease outcome, a 
possibility that has to be further explored.
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